
 

Program Incentives:
 
Any council that accomplishes the 
following will receive a BBQ picnic 
sponsored by the State Council for their 
council members and their families:
 
Faith:
Has the most members attend a Spiritual 
retreat (lesser of 25% or 25 
 
Community:
Has the most number of participants in 
the Soccer/
combined (minimum of 40 participants)
 
Family:
Council with the most members and 
families participating in Family Prayer 
Night (minimum of 15 families)
 
Life:
Has 
members marching in the Walk for Life 
(the lesser of 40 total participants or total 
participants equaling 40% of council 
membership)
 
Cor Incentives:
 
Any council that starts the Cor initiative 
at their Parish will be entered in
drawing to receive a BBQ put on by the 
State Council for their council members 
and their families.

 

Safe Environment Incentives: 
 
Council Drawing for $150 knightsgear 
gift cards:  
Any council Safe Environment compliant 
by Jul 31st, 2023 will be entered into a 
drawing with 5 opportunities to receive 
$150 in knightsgear gift cards (5 councils 
will be awarded $150 knightsgear gift 
cards). 
 
Council Drawing for State Deputy's 
Guest*: Any council safe environment 
compliant by Jul 31st will be entered into 
a drawing for 1 opportunity to be the 
State Deputy's guest for the 2024 State 
Convention.   
 
District Deputy $50 knightsgear gift 
cards:  
District Deputies with ALL their councils 
compliant by August 31st will receive 
$50 in knightsgear gift cards. 

* Guest will have the banquet dinner for 
both delegates and their wives paid for by 
the Oregon State Council. 

www.kofc.org/joinus

Program Incentives: 
 
Any council that accomplishes the 
following will receive a BBQ picnic 
sponsored by the State Council for their 
council members and their families: 
 
Faith: 
Has the most members attend a Spiritual 
retreat (lesser of 25% or 25 minimum) 
 
Community: 
Has the most number of participants in 
the Soccer/Free throw Challenges 
combined (minimum of 40 participants) 
 
Family: 
Council with the most members and 
families participating in Family Prayer 
Night (minimum of 15 families) 
 
Life: 
Has the most Knights and family 
members marching in the Walk for Life 
(the lesser of 40 total participants or total 
participants equaling 40% of council 
membership) 
 
Cor Incentives: 
 
Any council that starts the Cor initiative 
at their Parish will be entered into a 
drawing to receive a BBQ put on by the 
State Council for their council members 
and their families. 

 

Join NOW! 

www.kofc.org/joinus 

or 

English: 

 

Spanish: 

 


